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The Wave of the Future

NOTICE OF CLAIM

Date: June 12, 2017
To: Doug, Linda and Joan
Re: Claim from Joe Norris for damage to his car’s caused by the Knapp Street gate

at Wittman Regional Airport

This claim will be presented to the County Board at their June 20
2017 meeting.



Joe Norris

264 Old Oregon Rd
Oshkosh, WI 54902

Winnebago County Clerk
P.O. Box 2808

415 Jackson St.
Oshkosh, WI 54903-2808

RE: Vehicle damage caused by airport gate

To whom it may concern,

My vehicle (a 2003 Ford Mustang) was recently damaged by the gate behind the Theater In The
Woods, on Knapp St. Road, on the west side of the airport property. | have included copies of
the email chain between myself and airport manager Peter Moll. These emails include an
explanation of the incident and subsequent correspondence

Peter directed me to send this info to you for resolution. | have included the following:

A copy of my original email to Peter, explaining the incident

A copy of Peter’s reply to me, directing me to send this info to you
Photos of the damage to my vehicle

Two repair estimates

Please contact me with any questions you may have, or if you need more information from me.
| can be reached by phone at 920-426-6145 (work) or 920-279-2855 (mobile). | can be reached
via email at either jnorris@eaa.org or pilotjoe@ntd. net. My mailing address is shown above.

Thanks you very much for your prompt attention to this matter.

Regards,

Joe Norris



From: Joe Norris [mailto:pilotjoe @ntd.net]
Sent: Thursday, June 01, 2017 9:53 AM
To: Moll, Peter Subject: Airport Gate Problems

Hello Peter,

Last Sunday | was overseeing my EAA Sport Pilot Academy, which is operating out of Hangar C on the
EAA Convention grounds. (We're doing that so as to save taxi time due to the closure of all the runways
on the north side of the airport). After leaving Hangar C, | stopped over by the Vintage Red Barn to
inspect the progress on the remodeling project. From there | headed home.

Since | live south of town on Oregon St, the most direct way to go from the VAA Red Barn to my house
was to exit via the gate on Knapp St. Road, right behind the Theater In The Woods. So | pulled up to the
gate and nothing happened. | pulled a bit closer, and still nothing happened. So | pulled up closer yet.
By now | was really close to the gate, but it activated. | didn't think anything of it until | heard the
scraping noise and the gate came to a stop. The bracket that attaches the drive chain to the gate hit the
front of my car, putting a hole in the fascia. | have attached photos of the damage for your perusal.

So | checked with Karen here at EAA, and she tells me that the gate actually belongs to the airport and
not EAA, and that | should talk to you about getting the damage taken care of. | have procured two
estimates on the damage, and can provide them to you either electronically or hard-copy, as needed.

Let me know how to proceed.

Thanks,

Joe Norris
920-279-2855 (mobile)
920-426-6145 (work)



-------- Original Message -------—-

Subject: RE: Airport Gate Problems

Date: Thu, 1 Jun 2017 18:53:01 +0000

From: "Moll, Peter" <PMoll@co.winnebago.wi.us>
To: "'Joe Norris" <pilotjoe@ntd.net>

Joe:
Sorry to hear about the damage. First, | will have our crew check on the gate to ensure it is properly
working and aligned.

Second, here is the procedure for claims. You may submit a claim in writing to the Winnebago County
Clerk (415 Jackson St., PO Box 2808, Oshkosh, W1 54903-2808). Include as much documentation as
possible. For instance, send a copy of this e-mail, the photos of the damage, all estimates you may have,
and any other supporting documents that you feel will make your case. A police damage report is not
necessary.

The county clerk will submit the claim to the county board, which will then forward it to the Personnel &
Finance Committee for approval or denial, and then it will return to the county board for
approval/denial. This process may take 2-3 months.

Peter Moll

Airport Director

Wittman Regional Airport
525 W 20th Avenue
Oshkosh, WI 54902-6871
(920) 236-4930 office

(920) 233-7522 fax
pmoll@co.winnebago.wi.us




WESNER AUTO BODY Workfile ID: 87962536

"Over 50 Years of Expertise"
2025 Dickinson Avenue, OSHKOSH, WI 54904
Phone: (920) 231-4775

Preliminary Estimate

Customer: NORRIS, JOE Job Numbeyr:

Written By: Andy Wesner

Insured: NORRIS, JOE Policy #: Claim #:
Type of Loss: Date of Loss: Days to Repair: 0
Point of Impact: 12 Front

Owner: Inspection Location: Insurance Company:
NORRIS, JOE WESNER AUTO BODY

264 OLD OREGON RD 2025 Dickinson Avenue

OSHKOSH, WI 54902 OSHKOSH, WI 54904

(920) 688-2977 Evening Repair Facility

(920) 279-2855 Cell (920) 231-4775 Business

VEHICLE

2003 FORD Mustang Standard 2D CPE 6-3.8L Gasoline SMPI BLUE L2

Power Locks
Power Mirrors
DECOR

5/26/2017 4:52:01 PM

Rear Defogger
Keyless Entry
RADIO

Passenger Air Bag
4 Wheel Disc Brakes
SEATS

074810

VIN: 1FAFP40493F395349 Interior Color: Mileage In: Vehicle Out:

License: Exterior Color: BLUE L2 Mileage Out:

State: Production Date: Condition: Job #:
TRANSMISSION Dual Mirrors AM Radio Cloth Seats
Overdrive Tinted Glass FM Radio Bucket Seats
5 Speed Transmission Console/Storage Stereo Reclining/Lounge Seats
POWER CONVENIENCE Search/Seek WHEELS
Power Steering Air Conditioning CD Player Aluminum/Alloy Wheels
Power Brakes Intermittent Wipers SAFETY PAINT
Power Windows Tilt Whee! Drivers Side Air Bag Clear Coat Paint

OTHER

Power Trunk/Gate Release
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Preliminary Estimate

Customer: NORRIS, JOE Job Number:
2003 FORD Mustang Standard 2D CPE 6-3.8L Gasoline SMPI BLUE L2

Line Oper Description Part Number Qty Extended Labor Paint
Price $
1 FRONT BUMPER
2 Gt Repl  A/M CAPA Bumper cover base YR3Z17D957EA 1 269.00 1.8 2.0
3 Add for Clear Coat 0.8
4 # Repl Hazardous waste removal 1 3.00 X
5 # Repl Flex additive 1 500 T
SUBTOTALS 277.00 1.8 2.8
ESTIMATE TOTALS
Category Basis Rate Cost $
Parts 269.00
Body Labor 18hrs @ $ 60.00 /hr 108.00
Paint Labor 28hrs @ $ 60.00 /hr 168.00
Paint Supplies 28hrs @ $ 40.00 /hr 112.00
Miscellaneous 8.00
Subtotal 665.00
Sales Tax $665.00 @ 5.0000 % 33.25
Grand Total 698.25
Deductible 0.00
CUSTOMER PAY 0.¢9
INSURANCE PAY 698.25

5/26/2017 4:52:01 PM 074810 Page 2



LIFETIME GUARANTEE!

Tony’s auto cOLLISION CENTER & SALES, INC.

TONY'S AUTO COLLISION CENTER & SALES INC.
1825 S. WASHBURN ST.
OSHKOSH, WI 54904
OFFICE: 920-426-3700 FAX: 920-231-7343

| *++ PRELIMINARY ESTIMATE *** -~

05/26/2017 04:34 PM
r0wner l
Owner: JOE NORRIS
Address: 264 OLD OREGON RD Cell: (920)279-2855
Cell: (920)688-2977
City State Zip: Oshkosh, W1 54902 FAX:
Email: pilotjoe@ntd.net
Control Information _J
Loss Date/Time: 05/26/2017 04:33 PM Loss Type: Liability

Deductible:

None

Unspaction

Inspection Date:

05/26/2017 04:33 PM

Inspection Type:

Direct Repair Program

Inspection Location: tonys Contact:
City State Zip: Oshkosh, W1 54904 FAX:
Primary Impact: Front Secondary Impact:
Driveable: Yes Rental Assisted:
Contact: darren markert
|7Repalrer J
Repairer: Tony's Auto Collision Contact: Tony Combs
Address: 1825 South Washburn Ave. Work/Day: (920)426-3700
Home/Evening: (920)231-3384
City State Zip: Oshkosh, W1 54904 FAX: (920)231-7343
Target Complete Date/Time: Days To Repair: 2
[ venicle ' - i
2003 Ford Mustang STD 2 DR Coupe
6cyl Gasoline 3.8
4 Speed Automatic
Lic.Plate: 03 PONY Lic State: Wi
Lic Expire: VIN: 1FAFP40493F395349
Prod Date: 02/2003 Mileage: 76,304
Veh Insp# : Mileage Type: Actual
Condition: Good Code: P2212A
Ext. Color: TRUE BLUE MET Int. Color:
Ext. Refinish: Two-Stage Int. Refinish: Two-Stage
Ext. Paint Code: L2 Int. Trim Code:

Options

AM/FM CD Player

Air Conditioning

Alarm System

05/26/2017 04:34 PM
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Tony’s Auto COLLISION CENTER & SALES, INC. _ LIFETIME GUARANTEE!

Claim#: i 05/26/2017 04:34 PM

Aluminum/Alloy Wheels Black Grille Bucket Seats

Cargo/Trunk Net Center Console Compact Spare Tire

Dual Airbags Floor Mats Halogen Headlights

Intermittent Wipers Keyless Entry System Lighted Entry System

Power Brakes Power Door Locks Power Mirrors

Power Steering Power Windows Rear Window Defroster

Rem Trunk-L/Gate Release Split Folding Rear Seat Tachometer

Theft Deterrent System Tilt Steering Wheel Tinted Glass

Trip Computer Velour/Cloth Seats

Damages
Line Op Guide MC Description MFR.Part No. Price ADJ% B% Hours R
1 E 16 Cover,Front Bumper  YR3Z17D957EA $325.79 2.5 SM
2 L 16 13 Cover,Front Bumper Refinish 3.8 RF
2.7 Surface

0.6 Two-stage setup
0.5 Two-stage

.3 EC FLEX ADDITIVE Replace Economy $12.00" SM
4 UC HAZ WASTE Replace Reconditioned $5.00" SM
4 Items
MC Message
13 INCLUDES 0.6 HOURS FIRST PANEL TWO-STAGE ALLOWANCE

Estimate Total & Entries

Gross Parts $325.79
Other Parts $17.00
Paint & Materials 3.8 Hours @ $42.00 $159.60
Parts & Material Total $502.39
Tax on Parts & Material @ 5.000% $25.12

Labor Rate Replace Repair Hrs Total Hrs
Hrs

Sheet Metal (SM) $62.00 2.5 2.5 $155.00
Mech/Elec (ME) $90.00
Frame (FR) $75.00
Refinish (RF) $62.00 3.8 3.8 $235.60

Labor Total 6.3 Hours $390.60

Tax on Labor @ 5.000% $19.53

Gross Total $937.64
Less: Deductible None-

Net Total $937.64

Owner To Pay All Damages
Alternate Parts Y/00/00/00/00/00 CUM 00/00/00/00/00 Zip Code: 54904 Audatex Host

Rate Name Default

Audatex Estimating 8.0.134 ES 05/26/2017 04:34 PM REL 8.0.134 DT 05/01/2017 DB 05/15/2017
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Tony’s aute COLLISION CENTER & SALES, INC. __ LIFETIVE GUARANTEE!

e e 05/26/2017 04:34 PM
© 2017 Audatex North America, Inc.

1.1 HRS WERE ADDED TO THIS ESTIMATE BASED ON AUDATEX'S TWO-STAGE REFINISH FORMULA.

VISA OR MASTERCARD (WE IMPOSE A 2% SURCHARGE FEE ON CREDIT CARD PAYMENTS) ANY SUPPLEMENTS THAT ARE LEFT
OPEN ON YOUR ACCOUNT WILL BE BILLED TO YOUR INSURANCE COMPANY. A MECHANIC;S LIEN WILL REMAIN IN PLACE UNTIL
THE ACCOUNT IS PAID IN FULL.

THIS ESTIMATE HAS BEEN PREPARED BASED ON THE USE OF ONE OR MORE REPLACEMENT
PARTS SUPPLIED BY A SOURCE OTHER THAN THE MANUFACTURER OF YOUR MOTOR
VEHICLE. WARRANTIES APPLICABLE TO THESE REPLACEMENT PARTS ARE PROVIDED BY
THE MANUFACTURER OR DISTRIBUTOR OF THE REPLACEMENT PARTS RATHER THAN BY THE
MANUFACTURER OF YOUR MOTOR VEHICLE.

Op Codes

* = User-Entered Value A = Labor Matches System Assigned Rates E = Replace OEM

NG = Replace NAGS EC = Replace Economy OE = Replace PXN OE Srpls

UE = Replace OE Surplus ET = Partial Replace Labor EP = Replace PXN

EU = Replace Recycled TE = Partial Replace Price PM= Replace PXN Reman/Reblt
UM= Replace Reman/Rebuilt L = Refinish PC = Replace PXN Reconditioned
UC = Replace Reconditioned TT = Two-Tone SB = Sublet Repair

N = Additional Labor BR = Blend Refinish I = Repair

IT =Partial Repair CG= Chipguard Rl = R & | Assembly

P = Check AA = Appearance Allowance RP = Related Prior Damage

This report contains proprietary information of Audatex and may not be disclosed to any third party (other than
the insured, claimant and others on a need to know basis in order to effectuate the claims process) without

A u da tex Audatex's prior written consent.
& Solera company ‘ S -
o © 2017 Audatex North America, Inc. OLerO
S

AUDATEX is a trademark owned by Audatex North America, Inc. All rights reserved.
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