SUSAN T. ERTMER
County Clerk

DATE:

TO:

FROM:

RE:

Winnebago County
Office of the County Clerk

The Wave of the Future

NOTICE OF CLAIM

July 13, 2020
Doug Petraszak, Linda Staffaroni and Joan Lowe
Sue Ertmer

Claim from Tom Hanby

415 JACKSON STREET, P.O. BOX 2808
OSHKOSH, WISCONSIN 54903-2808

OSHKOSH (920) 236-4890

FOX CITIES (920 727-2880

FAX (920) 303-3025

E-mail: countyclerk@co.winnebago.wi.us

Mr. Hanby’s claim for damages to his motorcycle due to gravel thrown from
Winnebago County Highway Department truck will be presented to the County
Board at their July 21, 2020 meeting.
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PART NO.

MATERIAL USED

ALL PARTS NEW UNLESS SPECIFIED: U-USED, R-REBUILT, RC-RECONDITIONED
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"N, T PR (T e
ADDRESS g LUBRICATION D
v "4 CHANGE OIL ] i
2ND AUTHORIZED NAME [ PHONE
S CHANGE OIL FILTER CART. [_]
MAKE .ﬂ ;—.pgoﬁ _g RECEIVED (DATE& TIME) ~ AM. CHANGE TRANS. O
| .Nm il CHANGE DIFF. O
SERIAL #VIN ENGINE NO. PROMISED (DATE & TIME)  AM.
P, PACK FRONT WHEEL BRGS [_]
ODOMETER LICENSE NO. % ﬁ 3.‘ezo_,_ WHEN READY AT BRES 0
[Ino
Mu# ORDER WRITTEN BY CUSTOMER’S ORDER NO. ROTATETIRES L]
& o WASH POLISH O
OPER. NO. INSTRUCTIONS STATE INSPECTION O]

CHARGE FOR HAZARDOUS OR OTHER WASTE REMOVAL*

A

i i n¥ s Bepiair

Ponk  Lojreag Repoue

Esti i cost $

Estimate Charge

Basis for Charge

EXCEED $

ACCESSORY
NO.

Qry.

ACCESSORIES

OUTSIDE REPAIRS

BROUGHT FORWARD :

PARTS SAVED :
RETURNED TOTAL PARTS

PLEASE READ CAREFULLY, CHECK ONE OF THE STATEMENTS BELOW, AND SIGN:

| UNDERSTAND THAT, UNDER STATE LAW, | AM ENTITLED TO A WRITTEN ESTIMATE,

INCLUDING A COMPLETION DATE, IF MY FINAL BILL WILL EXCEED $100. ($50 in Maryland)

— | REQUEST AWRITTEN ESTIMATE. THE FINAL BILL MAY NOT EXCEED THIS ESTIMATE
WITHOUT MY WRITTEN APPROVAL.

— | DONOT REQUEST A WRITTEN ESTIMATE, AS LONG AS THE REPAIR COSTS DO NOT

. THE SHOP MAY NOT EXCEED THIS AMOUNT WITHOUT
MY WRITTEN OR ORAL APPROVAL.

— | DO NOT REQUEST A WRITTEN ESTIMATE.

*Checked lines apply (Preparer must check at least one):
____ This charge represents costs and profits to the motor vehicle repair facility for

following:

You are entitled by law to the return of all parts replaced, except those for
which there is a core charge, unless you agree otherwise by i

ing the

| do not desire the return of any of the parts that are
replaced during the authorized repairs.

Estimate good for 30 days. Not responsible for damage caused by theft, fire,
or acts of nature. | authorize the above repairs, along with any necessary

materials. | authorize you and your employees to operate my vehicle for the
purpose of testing, inspection, and delivery at my risk. An express mechan-

SIGNED

DATE

ic’s lien is hereby acknowledged on the above vehicle to secure the amount
of the repairs thereto. If | cancel repairs prior to their completion for any
reason, a tear-down and reassembly fee of $

will be applied.

>.m._.mm._o\m._.wm,—,_\._..mmmw
\et1

TOTAL ACCESSORIES

! ; & Daily storage fee after repair work has been| TOTAL LABOR :
miscellaneous shop supplies or waste disposal. completed and customer has been notfed.

____ This amount includes a charge of $ , which is required under No charges shall accrue or be due and pay-| TOTAL PARTS H
law. able for a period of 3 working days from date H

of notification. s AGCESSORIES :

METHOD OF PAYMENT: GAS, OIL, & GREASE PRICE GAS, OIL, & GREASE :
ASH HECK CHARGE , GUARANTEED ITEM(S) :
[Joasi Lo O GAS.GAS @ m OUTSIDE REPAIRS m
LABOR QTs. OlL @ STORAGE FEE (if applies)
I FLaT RATE [CJHOURLY [C]BOTH GUARANTEE EFFECTIVE UNTIL: 7
LBS. GREASE @ - TAX :

f_u RETAIN PARTS ] DESTROY PARTS | TOTAL GAS, OIL, & GREASE L —— TOTAL AMOUNT w
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Gregor, Cassie

From: Rob Gamble <bikerschoicerob@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, July 7, 2020 11:27 AM

To: Gregor, Cassie i

Subject: Gwd: Tom Hanby Claim N

Pics of front fairing

S Ly Prcleng

ROB GAMBLE 2l aand A

Ul AL A TN EE A
ROSHOLT MOTORCYCLE CO 7L S5t /7/5"/“/}‘-‘ ——
262-327-6396 LA /94"&5‘/&( &27':;/2%}7&/

7/7/ 20 3¢

/O ‘/?L’:?/}O
Begin forwarded message:

From: rmotorco <rmotorco@yahoo.com>
Date: July 6, 2020 at 11:51:21 CDT
To: Rob Gamble <bikerschoicerob@gmail.com>
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